
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2000 No. 2492

The Local Authorities (Members' Allowances)
(Amendment) (Wales) Regulations 2000

Citation, commencement and application

1.—(1)  These Regulations may be cited as the Local Authorities (Members' Allowances)
(Amendment) (Wales) Regulations 2000 and shall come into force on 13th September 2000.

(2)  These Regulations apply to Wales only.

Amendments

2.—(1)  The Local Authorities (Members' Allowances) Regulations 1991(1) are amended in
accordance with the following paragraphs.

(2)  In Regulation 17, in paragraph (2), for “£29.48” substitute “£30.39”.
(3)  In Regulation 18,

(a) in paragraph (1), for “£29.48” substitute “£30.39”;
(b) in paragraph (2),

(i) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£26.24” substitute “£27.65”; and
(ii) in sub-paragraphs (b) and (c), for “£52.49” substitute “£55.31”.

Revocation

3. The Local Authorities (Members' Allowances) (Amendment) Regulations 1999(2) and the
Local Authorities (Members' Allowances) (Amendment) (No. 2) Regulations 1999(3) are revoked
in relation to Wales.

Signed on behalf of the National Assembly for Wales under section 66(1) of the Government of
Wales Act 1998(4).

12th September 2000
Dafydd Elis Thomas

The Presiding Officer of the National Assembly

(1) S.I.1991/351; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1999/1086 and S.I. 1999/1087.
(2) S.I. 1999/1086.
(3) S.I. 1999/1087.
(4) 1998 c. 38.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/351
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/1086
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/1087
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/1086
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/1087
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1998/38

