
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2004 No. 1023

The National Assistance (Assessment of Resources)
(Amendment) (Wales) Regulations 2004

Amendment of Principal Regulations — Capital Limits

2.—(1)  The Principal Regulations are amended in accordance with the following paragraphs of
this regulation.

(2)  In regulation 20 (Capital limit), for the figure “£20,000”(1), substitute the figure “£20,500”.
(3)  In regulation 28(1) (Calculation of tariff income from capital), for the figure “£12,250”(2),

where it appears, substitute the figure “£13,500” and for the figure “£20,000”(3), substitute the figure
“£20,500”.

(1) This figure was inserted in relation to Wales by S.I. 2003/897 (W.117).
(2) This figure was inserted in relation to Wales by S.I. 2003/897 (W.117).
(3) This figure was inserted in relation to Wales by S.I. 2003/897 (W.117).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2003/897
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2003/897
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2003/897

