
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2014 No. 66

The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements
and Default Scheme) (Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2014

Amendments to the Council Tax Reduction Schemes and Prescribed Requirements (Wales)
Regulations 2013

6. In Schedule 1 (determining eligibility for a reduction under an authority’s scheme, amount of
reduction and calculation of income and capital: pensioners)—

(a) in paragraph 3 (non-dependant deductions: pensioners)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (1)(a) for “£10.95” substitute “£11.30”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (1)(b) for “£3.65” substitute “£3.75”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (2)(a) for “£186.00” substitute “£188.00”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (2)(b) for “£186.00”, “£322.00” and “£7.25” substitute “£188.00”,

“£326.00” and “£7.50” respectively;
(v) in sub-paragraph (2)(c) for “£322.00”, “£401.00” and “£9.15” substitute “£326.00”,

“£406.00” and “£9.45” respectively;
(vi) in sub-paragraph (7)(d)(i) for “regulation 24(6)” substitute “regulation 26(6)”;

(b) in paragraph 10(1)(v)(iii) (meaning of “income”: pensioners), in the Welsh text, for “ar ôl
talu rhent” substitute “am dalu rhent”;

(c) in paragraph 11(3)(b)(iii) (calculation of weekly income: pensioners), in the Welsh text,
for “ganiatáu” substitute “alluogi”;

(d) in paragraph 14(1)(b) (calculation of earnings self-employed earners: pensioners), in the
Welsh text, for “dros ba bynnag gyfnod” substitute “dros ba bynnag gyfnod arall”;

(e) in paragraph 19(14)(c) (treatment of child care charges: pensioners), for “Local
Government (Scotland) Act 1994” substitute “Local Government etc. (Scotland) Act
1994(1)”;

(f) in paragraph 24(4)(a) (calculation of deduction of tax and contributions of self-employed
earners), for “paragraph 23(3)(a) or, as the case may be, paragraph 23(4)” substitute
“paragraph 23(2)(a) or, as the case may be, paragraph 23(3)”.

(1) 1994 c.39.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/39

