
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 339

The National Health Service (Dental Charges)
(Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2017

Amendment to the National Health Service (Dental Charges) (Wales) Regulations 2006

2. In regulation 4 of the National Health Service (Dental Charges) (Wales) Regulations 2006(1)
(calculation of charges)—

(a) in paragraph (1), for “£13.50” substitute “£14.00”;
(b) in paragraph (2), for “£43.00” substitute “£44.00”;
(c) in paragraph (3), for “£185.00” substitute “£190.00”;
(d) in paragraph (4), for “£185.00” substitute “£190.00”; and
(e) in paragraph (5), for “£13.50” substitute “£14.00”.

(1) S.I. 2006/491 (W. 60), as amended.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2006/491

