Document Generated: 2024-07-21

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

SCHEDULES

SCHEDULE 6

Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2017

10. In regulation 45 (students with reduced entitlement)—

(@)

(b)

(©

(d)

(e)

®

in paragraph (1)(a)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£2,544” substitute “£2,625”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£4,768” substitute “£4,920”;
(ii1) in paragraph (iii), for “£3,392” substitute “£3,500”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£3,392” substitute “£3,500”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£3,392” substitute “£3,500”;
in paragraph (1)(b)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£2,544” substitute “£2,625”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£4,768” substitute “£4,920”;
(ii1) in paragraph (iii), for “£4,056” substitute “£4,186”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£4,056” substitute “£4,186”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£3,392” substitute “£3,500”;
in paragraph (1)(c)—

(i) in paragraph (i), for “£4,019” substitute “£4,147”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£7,273” substitute “£7,505”;
(ii1) in paragraph (iii), for “£6,190” substitute “£6,388”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£6,190” substitute “£6,388”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£5,191” substitute “£5,357”;

in paragraph (2)(a)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£1,934” substitute “£1,996”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£3,646” substitute “£3,763”;
(ii1) in paragraph (iii), for “£2,643” substitute “£2,727”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£2,643” substitute “£2,727”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£2,643” substitute “£2,727”;
in paragraph (2)(b)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£1,934” substitute “£1,996”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£3,644” substitute “£3,763”;
(ii1) in paragraph (iii), for “£2,965” substitute “£3,060”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£2,965” substitute “£3,060”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£2,643” substitute “£2,727”;
in paragraph (2)(c)—



Document Generated: 2024-07-21
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

(i) in paragraph (i), for “£3,638” substitute “£3,755”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£6,623” substitute “£6,834”;
(iii) in paragraph (iii), for “£5,384” substitute “£5,556;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£5,384” substitute “£5,556”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£4,809” substitute “£4,963”.



