Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 131

The Care and Support (Charging) (Wales) and Land Registration
Rules (Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2020

Amendment of the Care and Support (Charging) (Wales) Regulations 2015
2. The Care and Support (Charging) (Wales) Regulations 2015(1) are amended as follows—

(a) in regulation 7 (maximum weekly charge for non-residential care and support), in
paragraph (1) for “£90” substitute “£1007;

(b) in regulation 13 (minimum income amount where a person is provided with
accommodation in a care home) for “£29.50” substitute “£32”;

(c) inregulation 22 (maximum weekly contribution or reimbursement for non-residential care
and support) for “£90” substitute “£100”;

(d) in regulation 28 (minimum income amount where a person is provided with
accommodation in a care home) for “£29.50” substitute “£32”.

(1) S.1.2015/1843(W. 271); as amended by S.1. 2017/214 (W. 58), S.I. 2018/123 (W. 29), and S.1 2019/234 (W. 53).


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2015/1843
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2017/214
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2018/123
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2019/234

