
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student Finance)
(Amounts) (Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2020, PART 4. (See end of Document for details)

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 153

The Education (Student Finance) (Amounts)
(Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2020

PART 4
AMENDMENTS TO THE EDUCATION (POSTGRADUATE

DOCTORAL DEGREE LOANS) (WALES) REGULATIONS 2018

Amendments to the Education (Postgraduate Doctoral Degree Loans) (Wales) Regulations
2018

30. The Education (Postgraduate Doctoral Degree Loans) (Wales) Regulations 2018(1) are
amended in accordance with regulation 31.

Commencement Information
I1 Reg. 30 in force at 2.3.2020, see reg. 1(2)

Amendments to regulation 13

31. In regulation 13 (amount of postgraduate doctoral degree loan)—
(a) in paragraph (1), for “£25,700” substitute “£26,445”;
(b) in paragraph (2), for “£25,700” substitute “£26,445”.

Commencement Information
I2 Reg. 31 in force at 2.3.2020, see reg. 1(2)

(1) S.I. 2018/656 (W. 124) as amended by S.I. 2017/712 (W. 169), S.I. 2018/277 (W. 53) , S.I. 2018/814 (W. 165) , S.I. 2019/424
(W. 98) (as from exit day, as defined by European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018, section 20(1)–(5)), S.I. 2019/895 (W. 161).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2020/153/regulation/1/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2020/153/regulation/1/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2018/656
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2017/712
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2018/277
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2018/814
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2019/424
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2019/424
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2019/895


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student Finance)
(Amounts) (Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2020, PART 4.


