
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student Finance)
(Amounts) (Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2020, Section 10. (See end of Document for details)

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 153

The Education (Student Finance) (Amounts)
(Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2020

PART 2
AMENDMENTS TO THE EDUCATION (STUDENT

SUPPORT) (WALES) REGULATIONS 2017

Amendments to regulation 43

10. In regulation 43 (maximum amount of loans for eligible students with full entitlement who are
2010 cohort students, 2012 cohort students or 2012 accelerated graduate entry students undertaking
their first year of study)—

(a) in paragraph (2)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (i), for “£5,684” substitute “£5,848”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “£10,288” substitute “£10,584”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (iii), for “£8,756” substitute “£9,008”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (iv), for “£8,756” substitute “£9,008”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (v), for “£7,344” substitute “£7,555”;

(b) in paragraph (3) —
(i) in sub-paragraph (i), for “£5,147” substitute “£5,295”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “£9,368” substitute “£9,638”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (iii), for “£7,616” substitute “£7,835”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (iv), for “£7,616” substitute “£7,835”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (v), for “£6,803” substitute “£6,999”.

Commencement Information
I1 Reg. 10 in force at 2.3.2020, see reg. 1(2)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2020/153/regulation/1/2


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student Finance)
(Amounts) (Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2020, Section 10.


