
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 531

The Payments to Farmers (Controls and Checks)
(Wales) (Coronavirus) Regulations 2020

Modification of Commission Implementing Regulation (EU) No. 809/2014

2. For the purposes of claim year 2020, Commission Implementing Regulation (EU)
No. 809/2014 has effect as if—

(a) after the first subparagraph of Article 24(4), there were inserted—
“By way of derogation from the first subparagraph of this paragraph, the
competent authority may, in relation to the checks to be carried out in relation
to area-related aid schemes, use photo-interpretation of satellite or aerial ortho-
images or other relevant evidence including evidence provided by the beneficiary
at the request of the competent authority, including geotagged photos, which could
permit definitive conclusions to be drawn to the satisfaction of the competent
authority.”;

(b) after the third subparagraph of Article 26(4), there were inserted—
“By way of derogation from the first three subparagraphs of this paragraph, the
relevant authority may carry out the checks by the use of new technologies, or
other relevant evidence, including geotagged photos, in addition to the possibility
to use remote sensing in accordance with Article 40.”;

(c) in Article 30(d), for “5%”, there were substituted “3%”;
(d) in Article 31(1)(a), for “5%” in both places it occurs, there were substituted “3%”;
(e) Article 33a has been omitted;
(f) in Article 36(2), for “3%” there were substituted “1%”;
(g) in Article 68(1), for “1%” there were substituted “0.5%”.


