Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 73

The Education (Student Support) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2021

PART 3

AMOUNTS OF SUPPORT
CHAPTER 1

AMENDMENTS TO THE EDUCATION (STUDENT
SUPPORT) (WALES) REGULATIONS 2017

Amendments to regulation 19

15. In regulation 19 (new fee loan in respect of courses beginning on or after 1 September 2012)

(a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,470” substitute “£4,605”;
(b) in paragraph (4)(a), for “£2,160” substitute “£2,230”.



