Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 73

The Education (Student Support) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2021

PART 3

AMOUNTS OF SUPPORT
CHAPTER 1

AMENDMENTS TO THE EDUCATION (STUDENT
SUPPORT) (WALES) REGULATIONS 2017

Amendments to regulation 50

21. Inregulation 50 (increases in maximum amount), in paragraph (1)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£86” substitute “£89”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£167 substitute “£172”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£182” substitute “£188”;
(d) in sub-paragraph (d), for “£182” substitute “£188”;
(e) in sub-paragraph (e), for “£131” substitute “£135”.



