Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No. 403

The Education (Postgraduate Student Support)
(Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2022

PART 4

Amendments to the Education (Student Support)
(Postgraduate Master’s Degrees) (Wales) Regulations 2019
CHAPTER 4

Amendments relating to financial support

Amendments to regulation 31
23. Inregulation 31—
(a) in paragraph (2), for “£17,025” substitute “£17,430”;
(b) in paragraph (3)(b), for “£17,025” substitute “£17,430”.



