Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the
The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements and Default Scheme)
(Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2023, Section 8. (See end of Document for details)

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 47

The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements
and Default Scheme) (Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2023

Amendments to the Council Tax Reduction Schemes and Prescribed Requirements (Wales)
Regulations 2013

8. In Schedule 6 (determining eligibility for a reduction: persons who are not pensioners), in
paragraph 5 (non-dependant deductions: persons who are not pensioners)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (1)(a), for “£15.95” substitute “£16.40”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (1)(b), for “£5.30” substitute “£5.45”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (2)(a), for “£224.00” substitute “£236.00”;

(d) in sub-paragraph (2)(b), for “£224.00”, “£389.00” and “£10.60” substitute “£236.00”,
“£410.00” and “£10.90” respectively;

(e) in sub-paragraph (2)(c), for “£389.00”, “£484.00” and “£13.35” substitute “£410.00”,
“£511.00” and “£13.70” respectively.

Commencement Information
n Reg. 8 in force at 20.1.2023, see reg. 1(2)


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2023/47/regulation/1/2

Changes to legislation:
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Council Tax Reduction Schemes

(Prescribed Requirements and Default Scheme) (Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2023, Section
8.




