Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 87 (W. 17)
EDUCATION, WALES

The Education (Student Finance) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2023

Made - - - - 30 January 2023
Laid before Senedd

Cymru - - - - 1 February 2023
Coming into force 22 February 2023

THE EDUCATION (STUDENT FINANCEE MISCELLANEOUS
AMENDMENTS) (WALES) REGULATIONS 2023

PART 1

Title, commencement and application

1. Title and commencement
2. Application

PART 2
Amendments to the Education (Fees and Awards) (Wales) Regulations 2007

CHAPTER 1
Introduction

3. The Education (Fees and Awards) (Wales) Regulations 2007 are
amended...

CHAPTER 2
Students from British overseas territories and related amendments

4. In each of regulations 4(1B), 5(4), 6(5), 7(5) and 8(4)...
5. In the Schedule— (a) in paragraph 1—



Document Generated: 2023-10-09
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

CHAPTER 3
Family members of settled persons

6. In the Schedule, in paragraph 9D(1)(a) for “a United Kingdom...
PART 3

Amendments to the Education (European University Institute) (Wales) Regulations 2014
CHAPTER 1
Introduction

7. The Education (European University Institute) (Wales) Regulations
2014 are amended...

CHAPTER 2
Omission of redundant provisions

8. In regulation 6— (a) in paragraph (2)(b)(i), omit “2A,”, “9A,”...
9. In regulation 15— (a) in paragraph (1), for “Subject to...

10. In regulation 17— (a) in paragraph (1), for “Subject to...

I1. In regulation 20— (a) in paragraph (1), for “Subject to...

12. In regulation 22— (a) in paragraph (1), for “Subject to...

13. In Schedule 1— (a) in paragraph 1, in the definition...

PART 4

Amendments to the Higher Education (Qualifying Courses, Qualifying
Persons and Supplementary Provision) (Wales) Regulations 2015

CHAPTER 1
Introduction

14. The Higher Education (Qualifying Courses, Qualifying Persons and
Supplementary Provision)...

CHAPTER 2
Students from British overseas territories and related amendments
15. In the Schedule— (a) in paragraph 1(1), in paragraph (e)...
CHAPTER 3
Family members of settled persons

16. In the Schedule, in paragraph 9D(1)(a), for “a United Kingdom...



Document Generated: 2023-10-09

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

PART 5

Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2017

17.

18.
19.
20.
21.

22.
23.
24,
25.

26.
27.
28.
29.
30.
31.
32.

33.
34.
35.
36.

CHAPTER 1
Introduction

The Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2017 are
amended in...

CHAPTER 2
Financial support — uplifts

In regulation 16— (a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,295” substitute...
In regulation 19— (a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,705” substitute...
In regulation 24(3)(a), for “£32,546” substitute “£33,146”.

In regulation 26(3)— (a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£3,262”
substitute...

In regulation 27— (a) in paragraph (7)(a), for “£184” substitute...
In regulation 28(2), for “£1,862” substitute “£1,896”.

In regulation 43— (a) in paragraph (2)(i), for “£6,163” substitute...
In regulation 45— (a) in paragraph (1)(a)(i), for “£2,926”
substitute...

In regulation 50— (a) in paragraph (1)(a), for “£91” substitute...

In regulation 56— (a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,622” substitute...
In regulation 88(3)(a), for “£32,546” substitute “£33,146”.

In regulation 91— (a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£3,262” substitute...
In regulation 92— (a) in paragraph (6)(a), for “£184” substitute...
In regulation 93(2), for “£1,862” substitute “£1,896”.

In regulation 117(2)(a), for “£32,546” substitute “£33,146”.

CHAPTER 3
Grants for dependants

In regulation 29(2), for— (a) “£1,159” substitute “£1,180”;
In regulation 89(3), for “50” substitute “25”.

In regulation 94(2), for— (a) “£1,159” substitute “£1,180”;
In regulation 98— (a) for paragraph (3) substitute—

PART 6

Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2018

37.

CHAPTER 1
Introduction

The Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2018 are
amended in...



Document Generated: 2023-10-09
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

CHAPTER 2
Students from British overseas territories and related amendments

38. In regulation 9(1)(a)(i), after “6BA,” insert “6BB,”.

39. In regulation 44(1), in Exception 2, for the words from...

40. In regulation 54, in Exception 2, for the words from...

41. In regulation 62(2), in Exception 2, for the words from...

42. In regulation 69(2), in Exception 2, for the words from...

43, In regulation 80(2)(b)(iii), for “or 6D(a)” substitute “, 6D(1)(a) or...
44, In Schedule 2— (a) for paragraph 1(2)(d) substitute—

45. In Schedule 4, in paragraph 4(1)(a)(i)— (a) for “6A(2)” substitute...
46. In Schedule 7, in Table 16, at the appropriate places...

CHAPTER 3
Family members of settled persons
47. In Schedule 2, in paragraph 6C(a), for “a United Kingdom...
CHAPTER 4
Financial support — uplifts

48. In regulation 55, in Table 7— (a) in column 1,...

49. In regulation 56— (a) in Table 8—

50. In regulation 57(7), in Table 9— (a) in column 1,...

51. In regulation 58(2), in Table 10— (a) in column 1,...

52. In regulation 58 A(2), in Table 10A— (a) in column 1,...

53. In regulation 63(2), for “£32,546” substitute “£33,146”.

54. In regulation 72(2), in Table 11— (a) in column 1,...

55. In regulation 74, in Table 12— (a) in column 1,...

56. In regulation 76(2)— (a) in Table 13—

57. In Schedule 4, in paragraph 20(2), for “£32,546” substitute
“£33,146”....

CHAPTER 5
Grants for dependants

58. In regulation 69(1)(c), for “50%" substitute “25%"”.
59. In regulation 77— (a) in paragraph (1), for—

PART 7
Amendments to the Education (Postgraduate Doctoral Degree Loans) (Wales) Regulations 2018

CHAPTER 1
Introduction

60. The Education (Postgraduate Doctoral Degree Loans) (Wales)
Regulations 2018 are...



Document Generated: 2023-10-09

6l.
62.
63.

64.

65.

66.

67.

68.
69.
70.
71.

72.

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

CHAPTER 2

Students from British overseas territories and related amendments

In regulation 3(2)(a), after “10BA,” insert “10BB,”.
In regulation 8(d), for “or 10D(1)(a)” substitute *“, 10D(1)(a) or...
In Schedule 1— (a) in paragraph 1(1), at the appropriate...
CHAPTER 3
Family members of settled persons
In Schedule 1— (a) in paragraph 1(1), in paragraph (e)...
CHAPTER 4

Amendment to annual threshold

In regulation 14(5)(a), for “£10,609” substitute “fifty percent of
the...

CHAPTER 5
Financial support — uplifts

In regulation 13— (a) in paragraph (1), for “£27,880” substitute...
PART 8

Amendments to the Education (Student Support)
(Postgraduate Master’s Degrees) (Wales) Regulations 2019

CHAPTER 1
Introduction

The Education (Student Support) (Postgraduate Master’s Degrees)
(Wales) Regulations 2019...

CHAPTER 2

Students from British overseas territories and related amendments

In regulation 9(1)(a)(i), after “8BA,” insert “8BB,”.
In regulation 16(1)(b)(iii), for “or 8D(a)” substitute “, 8D(1)(a) or...
In Schedule 2 — (a) in paragraph 1(2)(d)—
In Schedule 4, in Table 3, at the appropriate places...
CHAPTER 3

Family members of settled persons

In Schedule 2, in paragraph 8C(a), for “a United Kingdom...



Document Generated: 2023-10-09
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made).

CHAPTER 4
Financial support — uplifts

73. In regulation 31— (a) in paragraph (2), for “£17,430” substitute...
74. In regulation 36— (a) in paragraph (8), for “£17,430” substitute...
Signature
Explanatory Note



