
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 87

The Education (Student Finance) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2023

PART 7
Amendments to the Education (Postgraduate

Doctoral Degree Loans) (Wales) Regulations 2018

CHAPTER 5

Financial support – uplifts

66. In regulation 13—
(a) in paragraph (1), for “£27,880” substitute “£28,395”;
(b) in paragraph (2)(b), for “£27,880” substitute “£28,395”.


