
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2024 No. 86 (W. 24)

EDUCATION, WALES

The Education (Student Finance) (Amounts)
(Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2024

Made       -      -      -      - 24 January 2024
Laid before Senedd
Cymru       -      -      -      - 26 January 2024

Coming into force 22 February 2024

THE EDUCATION (STUDENT FINANCE)
(AMOUNTS) (MISCELLANEOUS

AMENDMENTS) (WALES) REGULATIONS 2024

PART 1

Title, coming into force and application

1. Title and coming into force  
2. Application  

PART 2

Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2017

CHAPTER 1

Introduction

3. The Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2017 are
amended in...

 

CHAPTER 2

Financial support

4. In regulation 16— (a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,215” substitute...  
5. In regulation 19— (a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,785” substitute...  
6. In regulation 24(3)(a), for “£33,146” substitute “£33,460”.  



Document Generated: 2024-02-27
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

7. In regulation 26(3)— (a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£3,322”
substitute...

 

8. In regulation 27— (a) in paragraph (7)(a), for “£187” substitute...  
9. In regulation 28(2), for “£1,896” substitute “£1,914”.  

10. In regulation 43— (a) in paragraph (2)(i), for “£6,277” substitute...  
11. In regulation 45— (a) in paragraph (1)(b)(i), for “£2,980”

substitute...
 

12. In regulation 50(1)— (a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£93” substitute...  
13. In regulation 56— (a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,708” substitute...  
14. In regulation 88(3)(a), for “£33,146” substitute “£33,460”.  
15. In regulation 91(3)— (a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£3,322”

substitute...
 

16. In regulation 92— (a) in paragraph (6)(a), for “£187” substitute...  
17. In regulation 93(2), for “£1,896” substitute “£1,914”.  
18. In regulation 117(2)(a), for “£33,146” substitute “£33,460”.  

CHAPTER 3

Grants for dependants

19. In regulation 29(2), for— (a) “£1,180” substitute “£1,192”;  
20. In regulation 94(2), for— (a) “£1,180” substitute “£1,192”;  

PART 3

Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2018

CHAPTER 1

Introduction

21. The Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2018 are
amended in...

 

CHAPTER 2

Financial support

22. In regulation 55, in Table 7— (a) in column 1,...  
23. In regulation 56— (a) in Table 8—  
24. In regulation 57(7), in Table 9— (a) in column 1,...  
25. In regulation 58(2), in Table 10— (a) in column 1,...  
26. In regulation 58A(2), in Table 10A— (a) in column 1,...  
27. In regulation 63(2), for “£33,146” substitute “£33,460”.  
28. In regulation 72(2), in Table 11— (a) in column 1,...  
29. In regulation 74, in Table 12— (a) in column 1,...  
30. In regulation 76— (a) in paragraph (2), in Table 13—...  
31. In Schedule 4, in paragraph 20(2), for “£33,146” substitute

“£33,460”....
 



Document Generated: 2024-02-27
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

CHAPTER 3

Grants for dependants

32. In regulation 77, in paragraph (1) for—  

PART 4

Amendments to the Education (Postgraduate Doctoral Degree Loans) (Wales) Regulations 2018

CHAPTER 1

Introduction

33. The Education (Postgraduate Doctoral Degree Loans) (Wales)
Regulations 2018 are...

 

CHAPTER 2

Financial support

34. In regulation 13— (a) in paragraph (1), for “£28,395” substitute...  
  Signature  
  Explanatory Note  


