
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2024 No. 86

The Education (Student Finance) (Amounts)
(Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2024

PART 3
Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2018

CHAPTER 1

Introduction

21. The Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2018(1) are amended in accordance
with this Part.

CHAPTER 2

Financial support

22. In regulation 55, in Table 7—
(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2023” insert “but before 1

September 2024”;
(b) at the end of the Table, insert the following table entry—

“Beginning on or
after 1 September
2024

Category 1 Living at home £9,315

Living away from home,
studying in London

£14,170

Living away from home,
studying elsewhere

£11,150

Category 2 Living at home £4,655

Living away from home,
studying in London

£7,085

Living away from home,
studying elsewhere

£5,575”

23. In regulation 56—
(a) in Table 8—

(i) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2023” insert “but before 1
September 2024”;

(1) S.I. 2018/191 (W. 42); relevant amendments are S.I. 2018/813 (W. 164); S.I. 2019/235 (W. 54); S.I. 2020/153 (W. 27); S.I.
2021/73 (W. 19); S.I. 2022/79 (W. 28); S.I. 2023/87 (W. 17) and S.I. 2023/1349 (W. 243).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2018/191
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2018/813
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2019/235
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2020/153
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/73
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/73
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2022/79
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2023/87
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2023/1349


Document Generated: 2024-02-24
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(ii) at the end of the Table, insert the following table entry—

“Beginning on or after 1
September 2024

Living at home £10,315

Living away from home,
studying in London

£15,170

Living away from home,
studying elsewhere

£12,150”

(b) in Table 8A—
(i) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2023” insert “but before 1

September 2024”;
(ii) at the end of the Table, insert the following table entry—

“Beginning on or after 1
September 2024

Living at home £4,655

Living away from home,
studying in London

£7,085

Living away from home,
studying elsewhere

£5,575”

24. In regulation 57(7), in Table 9—
(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2023” insert “but before 1

September 2024”;
(b) at the end of the Table, insert the following table entry—

“Beginning on or after 1
September 2024

Living at home £94

Living away from home,
studying in London

£181

Living away from home,
studying elsewhere

£142”

25. In regulation 58(2), in Table 10—
(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2023” insert “but before 1

September 2024”;
(b) at the end of the Table, insert the following table entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 September 2024 £7,965 multiplied by the intensity of study”

26. In regulation 58A(2), in Table 10A—
(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2023” insert “but before 1

September 2024”;
(b) at the end of the Table, insert the following table entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 September 2024 £8,965 multiplied by the intensity of study”

2



Document Generated: 2024-02-24
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

27. In regulation 63(2), for “£33,146” substitute “£33,460”.

28. In regulation 72(2), in Table 11—
(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2023” insert “but before 1

September 2024”;
(b) at the end of the Table, insert the following table entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 September 2024 £3,353”

29. In regulation 74, in Table 12—
(a) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2023” insert “but before 1

September 2024”;
(b) at the end of the Table, insert the following table entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 September 2024 £1,914”

30. In regulation 76—
(a) in paragraph (2), in Table 13—

(i) in column 1, after “Beginning on or after 1 September 2023” insert “but before 1
September 2024”;

(ii) at the end of the Table, insert the following table entry—

“Beginning on or after 1 September
2024

One dependent child £189

More than one dependent child £324”

(b) in paragraph (4)(a), for “£144” substitute “£145”.

31. In Schedule 4, in paragraph 20(2), for “£33,146” substitute “£33,460”.

CHAPTER 3

Grants for dependants

32. In regulation 77, in paragraph (1) for—
(a) “£6,272” substitute “£6,332”;
(b) “£8,629” substitute “£8,711”;
(c) “£9,809” substitute “£9,902”;
(d) “£10,996” substitute “£11,100”.

3


