Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2024 No. 86

The Education (Student Finance) (Amounts)
(Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2024

PART 4
Amendments to the Education (Postgraduate
Doctoral Degree Loans) (Wales) Regulations 2018
CHAPTER 1
Introduction

33. The Education (Postgraduate Doctoral Degree Loans) (Wales) Regulations 2018(1) are
amended in accordance with this Part.

CHAPTER 2
Financial support

34. Inregulation 13—
(a) in paragraph (1), for “£28,395” substitute “£28,655”;
(b) in paragraph (2)(b), for “£28,395” substitute “£28,655”.

(1) S.I.2018/656 (W. 124); relevant amendments are S.I. 2019/235 (W. 54); S.I. 2020/153 (W. 27); S.I. 2021/73 (W. 19); S.L.
2022/403 (W. 100) and S.I. 2023/87 (W. 17).


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2018/656
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2019/235
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2020/153
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/73
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2022/403
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2022/403
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2023/87

